VILLAGE OF GILBERTS
RESOLUTION 05-2024

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF WATER SOFTENER SALT
FOR CALENDAR YEAR 2024 FROM MIDWEST SALT

WHEREAS, the Village of Gilberts (“Village”) operates and maintains a water treatment
facility; and

WHEREAS, the Village utilizes water softener salt as part of the water treatment process;
and

WHEREAS, the Village annually budgets for the purchase of water softener salt for the
treatment process; and

WHEREAS, Public Works participated in a joint bid effort with multiple neighboring
municipalities as part of the McHenry County Joint Purchasing Cooperative for the purchase of
water softener salt with the lowest responsive and responsible bidder being Midwest Salt at
$146.00 per ton;

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD OF
TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF GILBERTS, ILLINOIS, as follows:

Section 1.  Recitals. The recitals set forth above are hereby incorporated into and made
a part of this Resolution as though set forth in this Section 1.

Section 2. Approval; Authorization. The Village Board of Trustees hereby
authorizes the Village Administrator to execute an agreement and other necessary documents with
Midwest Salt for the purchase of water softener salt at a rate of $146.00 per ton.

Section 3. Effective Date. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect after its
approval in the manner provided by law.

PASSED BY V(h)TE OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES of the Village of Gilberts, Kane

County, Illinois, this 16" day of January, 2024. .
g ! hyes Y Neys Abgert fostaif

Trustee Robert Vanni ¥,
Trustee Frank Marino
Trustee Brandon Coats
Trustee Jeanne Allen
Trustee Robert Chapman
Trustee Justin Redfield
President Guy Zambetti
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Resolution No. 05-2023
APPROVED"IH,LS, 16th DAY OF JANUARY, 2024.
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B WOODSTOCK

ILLINOIS

City of Woodstock Department of Public Works
2024 Water Softener Salt Joint Bid

Bid Opening: 10:00 am, Friday, December 1, 2023
ber 19, 2023

Councll €

fon: Tuesday, Di

BASEBIDYR1

BASEBID YR2

West Chicago, IL

BIDDER (9,860 TONS EST) (9,860 TONS ES7) c  Exceptions
Annual Cost Annual Cost
Morton Salt
;. No Bid
Chicago, IL © No Bid
Compass Minerals
0.00 X
Overland Park, KS $ s0.00
Midwest Salt
1,439,560.00 .
Waest Chicago, It $1,439, $0.00
_Gontralled Flow Slotted Tallgate (25 ton capacity) -
BIDDER 2024 Unit Price 2024 Cost 2025 Unit Price 2025 Cost
Total for All Agencies Base Bid Year 1 Bid Total for All Agencles Base Bld Year 2 Bid Total for Alf Agencies
Morton Salt No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chlcago, L
Compass Minerals Estimated quantity 7,763
0.00 X 0.00 - 0.0
Overland Park, KS tons § $0.00 $ 5000
Midwaest Salt
46.0 1,133,398.00 .0 0.00
West Chicago, IL $146.00 $1,133, 5000 5
B BRI ST P e
BIDDER 2023 Unit Price 2024 Cost 2025 Unit Price 2025 Cost
Total for All Agencies Base Bid Year 1 Bid Total for All Agencles Base Bid Year 2 Bid Total for All Agencles
Marton Salt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chicago, IL
Compass [ dg Y .
L ; L X 0.00 . 0.00
Overland Park; kS 697 tons $0.00 $ $0.00 §
Midwast Salt $146.00 $101,762.00 $0.00 $0.00

2025 Unit Price

2025 Cost

West Chicago, IL

BIDDER 2024 Unit Price
Total for All Agencies Base Bid Year 1 Bid Total for All Agencies Base Bid Year 2 gid Total far All Agenclas
Morton Sait No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chicago, IL
Compass Minerals Estimated quantity
0.00 X 0.00 0.00
Overland Park, KS 1,400 tons § $0.00 $ §
Midwest salt $146.00 $204,400.00 $0.00 $0.00

West Chicago, IL

(9,860 TONS EST} {9,860 TONS EST) e , .
BIDDER Annual Cost 2024 Annual Cast 2025 Exceptions

Marton satt No Bid No Bid
Chicagg, IL
Compass Minerals

1,585,994.00 0.00
Overland Park, KS § so.0
Midwest Salt $1,439,560.00 $0.00

2024 Unit Price

1o capacity}

2025 Cost

West Chicago, IL

BIDDER 2024 Cost 2025 Unit Price
Total for All Agencles Base Bid Year 1 Bid Total for All Agencies Base Bid Year 2 Bid Total for Ali Agencies
Mortan Salt No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid
Chicago, IL
Compass Minerals Estimated quantity 7,763
. X X 0.00
Overland Park, KS tons $160.00 $1,242,080.00 $0.00 $
|Midwest Salt
146.00 1,133,398, 0.00 0.00
West Chicago, IL $ $1,133,398.00 $ $
. e e Tridek & Bup LA : s
BIDDER 2024 Unlt Price 2024 Cost 2025 Unit Price 2025 Cost
Total for All Agencies Base Bid Year 1 Bid Total for All Agencies Base Bid Year 2 Bid Total for All Agentles
Marton Salt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chicago, IL
Compass Minerals Estimated quantity
X ,914. X 0.00
Overland Park, KS 697 tons §162.00 $112,914.00 $0.00 §
Midwest Salt
146.00 762 0.00 0.00
West Chicago, IL 8 $101,762.00 3 $
TR LT TRk withPasumatle R R
BIDDER 2024 Unit Price 2024 Cost 2024 Unit Price 2024 Cost
Total for All Agencies Base Bid Year 1 Bid Total for All Agencies Base Bid Year 2 Bid Total for All Agencies
Morton Salt
Bid No Bid
Chicago, Il No 8id No Bid No o
Compass Minerals Estimated quantity
165, X 0.00 0.00
Overland Park, XS 1,400 tons $165.00 $231,000.00 $ $
Midwest Salt $146.00 $204,400.00 $0.00 $0.00




